
Subject: Re: Updated parking
From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>
Date: 06/29/2018 04:02 PM
To: "tcollins@classicparking.com" <tcollins@classicparking.com>
CC: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Lulu Woldemariam
<lulu@southpark.la>, 'Angelito Dimazana' <taynay20245@verizon.net>,
"Enrique Espin" <espin@grantparking.net>, 'Shannon Garner'
<sgarner@classicparking.com>, 'Juana Ocampo' <juana@classicparking.com>

Hi again Tiffany,

Just spoke with my accountant – he’s processing now, but payment won’t reach you until 
probably Thursday. I’ll issue a handwritten check instead and will drop it off to your 
office. Are you still there?

From: "tcollins@classicparking.com" <tcollins@classicparking.com>
Date: Friday, June 29, 2018 at 3:22 PM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>
Cc: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Lulu Woldemariam <lulu@southpark.la>, 'Angelito 
Dimazana' <taynay20245@verizon.net>, Enrique Espin <espin@grantparking.net>, 'Shannon 
Garner' <sgarner@classicparking.com>, 'Juana Ocampo' <juana@classicparking.com>
Subject: RE: Updated parking

Hi Ellen,

I was really hoping we would have received a payment this week.

Unfortunately, we will need to discontinue South Park’s parking as of July 1, 2018, until 
all payments have been resolved.

Please return all 6 keycards to the parking office.  All keycards were issued without 
deposits.

Thank you,

Tiffany Collins

Classic Parking, Inc.

1111 Hope Street, L.A., CA 90015

(213) 748-1459

Re: Updated parking
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From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Friday, June 29, 2018 11:05 AM
To: tcollins@classicparking.com
Cc: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org>; Lulu Woldemariam <lulu@southpark.la>; 'Angelito 
Dimazana' <taynay20245@verizon.net>
Subject: Re: Updated parking

My apologies, Tiffany. Our accountant is out of town this week so the processing of our 
invoices is slightly delayed. I’ll ping him again today as a reminder.

From: "tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com> " 
<tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com> >
Date: Friday, June 29, 2018 at 10:08 AM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> >
Cc: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >, Lulu Woldemariam 
<lulu@southpark.la <mailto:lulu@southpark.la> >, 'Angelito Dimazana' 
<taynay20245@verizon.net <mailto:taynay20245@verizon.net> >
Subject: RE: Updated parking

Good morning Ellen,

Will you please deliver the check for May and June today?

Please let me know the status.

Thank you.

Tiffany Collins

Classic Parking, Inc.

1111 Hope Street, L.A., CA 90015

(213) 748-1459

Re: Updated parking
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From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 12:37 PM
To: tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com>
Cc: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >; Lulu Woldemariam 
<lulu@southpark.la <mailto:lulu@southpark.la> >; Angelito Dimazana 
<taynay20245@verizon.net <mailto:taynay20245@verizon.net> >
Subject: Re: Updated parking

Yes, we are processing as we speak. Thanks!

From: "tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com> " 
<tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com> >
Date: Monday, June 25, 2018 at 12:27 PM
To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> >
Cc: 'Robert Buente' <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >, Lulu Woldemariam 
<lulu@southpark.la <mailto:lulu@southpark.la> >, Angelito Dimazana 
<taynay20245@verizon.net <mailto:taynay20245@verizon.net> >
Subject: RE: Updated parking

Hi Ellen, thank you.

Also, can we expect the check for May and June this week?

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Monday, June 25, 2018 12:08 PM
To: tcollins@classicparking.com <mailto:tcollins@classicparking.com>
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org <mailto:bbuente@1010dev.org> >; Lulu Woldemariam 
<lulu@southpark.la <mailto:lulu@southpark.la> >
Subject: Updated parking

Hi Tiffany,

Hope you’re well. I’m emailing to let you know that we no longer require monthly parking 
for the 4 staff vehicles, as of tomorrow, 6/26/18. For now, we’ll continue to park the 2 
trucks overnight. 

Thank you,

Ellen

Re: Updated parking
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Ellen Riotto 

Executive Director

South Park Business Improvement District

1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la>  | o. 213 663 1112 

southpark.la <http://www.southpark.la/>  | Facebook <http://fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles>  | 
Twitter <https://twitter.com/southparkla>  | Instagram <https://www.instagram.com
/southparkla/>
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